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Od: Mariusz Mróz
Komu: Rabasová Tereza
Predmět: RE: Order
Datum: 3. listopadu 2016 10:00:32


Dear Tereza,
 
Yes, I have received the purchase order.
I will send you an invoice in the shortest possible time.
 
Best regards,
Mariusz Mróz
Electronics Engineer / Inżynier Elektronik
tel: +48 (22) 233 10 27 
mobile: +48 516 911 768
mail: mariusz.mroz@creotech.pl


***************************************************************************************************************


Creotech Instruments S.A. z siedzibą w Piasecznie, 05-500, ul. Gen. L.
Okulickiego 7/9,
NIP: 951-224-43-13; kapitał zakładowy 140 123,20 PLN, opłacony w całości;
Sąd Rejonowy dla m.st. Warszawy,
XIV Wydział Gospodarczy Krajowego Rejestru Sądowego KRS 0000407094.


Treść tej wiadomości jest poufna i prawnie chroniona. Odbiorcą może być jedynie
jej adresat z wyłączeniem dostępu osób trzecich. Jeżeli nie jesteś adresatem
niniejszej wiadomości, jej rozpowszechnianie, kopiowanie, rozprowadzanie lub
inne działanie o podobnym charakterze jest prawnie zabronione i może być
karalne.
---------------------------------------------
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged. It
is intended solely for the addresser. Access to this email by anyone else is
unauthorised. If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying,
distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is
prohibited and may be unlawful.
 
 
 


From: Rabasová Tereza [mailto:Tereza.Rabasova@eli-beams.eu] 
Sent: Wednesday, November 02, 2016 7:10 PM
To: Mariusz Mróz <mariusz.mroz@creotech.pl>
Subject: FW: Order
 
Dear Mariusz,
 
Have you received this order? I would like to ask you for a confirmation and Invoice.
 
Thank you.
 
Best,
 
Tereza
 


From: Rabasová Tereza 
Sent: Sunday, October 30, 2016 9:09 AM
To: 'Mariusz Mróz'
Cc: Gaman Vojtěch
Subject: Order
 
Dear  Mariusz,  
 
I am sending you an Order based on Contract with your company. Please confirm it and send it as soon as possible.
 
I would like to kindly ask you to ad to an Invoice order number and number of project CZ.02.1.01/0.0/0.0/15_008/0000162
name ELI - EXTREME LIGHT INFRASTRUCTURE - fáze 2. Our company prefer e-invoicing to efaktury@fzu.cz. Due to our long
authorization procedure, we need to make a payment via Invoice with due at least 21 days.
 
There is VAT in orders, because It was generated by our IT Program. Please do not pay a attention to it.
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Thank you very much for understanding and cooperation.
 
Kind Regards, 
 
Ing. Tereza Rabasová
Procurement  specialist
 


 
ELI Beamlines Czech Republic
Tel.: +420 266 051396
Mobil:  +420 702 195 269
E-mail: tereza.rabasova@eli-beams.eu
www.eli-beams.eu
 
Fyzikální ústav AV ČR, v. v. i.
Na Slovance 1999/2
182 21 Praha 8
 
Kontaktní adresa:
Fyzikální ústav AV ČR, v.v.i./ ELI Beamlines
Za Radnicí 835
252 41 Dolní Břežany
 
 
S pozdravem,
 
Ing. Tereza Rabasová
Procurement  specialist
 


 
ELI Beamlines Czech Republic
Tel.: +420 266 051396
Mobil:  +420 702 195 269
E-mail: tereza.rabasova@eli-beams.eu
www.eli-beams.eu
 
Fyzikální ústav AV ČR, v. v. i.
Na Slovance 1999/2
182 21 Praha 8
 
Kontaktní adresa:
Fyzikální ústav AV ČR, v.v.i./ ELI Beamlines
Za Radnicí 835
252 41 Dolní Břežany
 
 
 



mailto:tereza.rabasova@eli-beams.eu

http://www.eli-beams.eu/

mailto:tereza.rabasova@eli-beams.eu

http://www.eli-beams.eu/



