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Dear Dr. Heneberg, 
 
Thank you for submitting your manuscript to One Health. 
 
I am pleased to inform you that your manuscript has been accepted for publication.   
 
My comments, and any reviewer comments, are below.    
Your accepted manuscript will now be transferred to our production department. We will create a 
proof which you will be asked to check, and you will also be asked to complete a number of online 
forms required for publication. If we need additional information from you during the production 
process, we will contact you directly. 
 
We appreciate you submitting your manuscript to One Health and hope you will consider us again 
for future submissions. 
 
We encourage authors of original research papers to share the research objects – including raw 
data, methods, protocols, software, hardware and other outputs – associated with their paper. 
More information on how our open access Research Elements journals can help you do this is 
available at https://www.elsevier.com/authors/tools-and-resources/research-elements-
journals?dgcid=ec_em_research_elements_email. 
 
Kind regards,   
Malcolm Jones   
Editor-in-Chief 
 
One Health 
 
Editor and Reviewer comments: 
 
 
 
Reviewer #2: The author carefully responded to the suggestions for revision I had made and made 
the necessary changes in the manuscript. Suggestion for acceptance. 
  
 
  
 
More information and support  
 
FAQ: When and how will I receive the proofs of my article? 
https://service.elsevier.com/app/answers/detail/a_id/6007/p/10592/supporthub/publishing/related
/ 
 
FAQ: How can I reset a forgotten password? 
https://service.elsevier.com/app/answers/detail/a_id/28452/supporthub/publishing/ 
For further assistance, please visit our customer service site: 
https://service.elsevier.com/app/home/supporthub/publishing/ 
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Here you can search for solutions on a range of topics, find answers to frequently asked questions, 
and learn more about Editorial Manager via interactive tutorials. You can also talk 24/7 to our 
customer support team by phone and 24/7 by live chat and email 
 
At Elsevier, we want to help all our authors to stay safe when publishing. Please be aware of 
fraudulent messages requesting money in return for the publication of your paper. If you are 
publishing open access with Elsevier, bear in mind that we will never request payment before the 
paper has been accepted. We have prepared some guidelines 
(https://www.elsevier.com/connect/authors-update/seven-top-tips-on-stopping-apc-scams ) that 
you may find helpful, including a short video on Identifying fake acceptance letters 
(https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=o5l8thD9XtE ). Please remember that you can contact 
Elsevier s Researcher Support team 
(https://service.elsevier.com/app/home/supporthub/publishing/) at any time if you have questions 
about your manuscript, and you can log into Editorial Manager to check the status of your 
manuscript 
(https://service.elsevier.com/app/answers/detail/a_id/29155/c/10530/supporthub/publishing/kw/s
tatus/). 
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