
Airbus Helicopters Deutschland GmbH
lndustriestarsse 4
86609 Donauworth
GERMANY

Repair Order No. 190058 Date 10.12.2024

Supplier No.: 70001

Your Reference: Our Reference:
e-mail:

LS-2-55/CJ-2024-9800KR

Pos Part No. / Description Quantity Discount Unit pňce Tota!

1 3290008-311 1,00 EA
TFU
S/N PDX190186
Unusual sounds from turret when moved in EL axis.
Standard repair is required.
Removed from EC135T2+ S/N 0499

2 3204853-10 1,00 EA
UNIVERSAL HAND CONTROL UN1T FS
S/N PDX300559
Zoom sIider does not work.
Standard repair is required.
Removed from EC135T2+ S/N 0499

3 3204853-10 1,00 EA
UNIVERSAL HAND CONTROL UNIT FS
S/N PDX300590
Zoom slider does not work.
Standard repair is required.
Removed from EC135T2+ S/N 0424
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Pos Part No. / Description Quantity

LETECXA 5LLjZBA, POJCIE CE5CE AmjBL(KY

Purchase Order No. 190058
Discount Unit Price Total

Please send the invoice with due date 30 days, send to
the recipient's address. In the invoice we need
both following addresses:

CUSTOMER
Ministerstvo vnitra CR
Nad Stolou 936/3;
170 34 Praha

RECIPIENT
Policie CR letecka sluzba
P.O.BOX 2
163 00 Praha 618
lCO: 00007064; DIC: CZ00007064
Bank: 5504-881/0710

DELIVERY ADDRESS
Czech Police Aviation Department
Airport Vaclav Havel, south area
Hangar D

Contract - LS-565-35/CJ-2022-9800KR

Zakazka je vyporadana Ramcovou dohodou
LS-565-35/CJ-2022-9800KR
k dodavce ND, oprav, modifikaci,modernizace a sluzeb pro
vrtulniky lehke hmotnostni kategorie EC 135
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LS PČR - oddělení nákupu

Od:

Odesláno:
Komu:
Kopie:
Předmět:

za uživatele Order-easy (AH) Contact

9. prosince 2024 14:12
LS PČR - oddělení nákupu

Re: LS-2-55/ČJ-2024-9800KR

Dear

P/N: 3290008-311 is NOT REPAIRABLE only as SPARE part available.
For P/N: 3204853-10 price for REPAIR is ON QUOTE (after the part is inspected a quotation is
created) and TAT of 195 days (after inspection).

Best regards

-Consultant Order Logistic Management-
Division Aerospace & Defence, Naval

AKKODIS AS&D GmbH 1 Dr. Ludwig-Bôlkow-StraBe 1| 86609 Donauwôrth| Germany

on behalf of Airbus Helicopters

On Mon, Dec 9, 2024 at 2:00 PM wrote:

Dear,

We would like to asky ou to sen dus a price quation for the repair items - see attachment

Thank you very much

Best regards
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