
CZECH POLICE AVIATION DEPARTMENT

Ref. No. LS-3-33/ČJ-2024-9800KR

Prague, P. O. 614, Box 35, Postcode 161 01
Czech Republic

Prague 24.5.2024
No. of pages 2

SAFRAN Helicopter Engines Germany
Borsteler Chausse 43
D-22453 Hamburg
GERMANY

ORDER
We request carrying out the repair of the below mentioned item, ordered by our

department, ref. No LS-3-33/Čj-2024-9800KR:

P/N S/N
VALVE ASSY, 0319950340 1415 1 PC

ADJUSTED

We ask for repair of
defective STOP ELECTRO
VALVE. Missing PLUG
from TU117.
TSN 1219
Helicopter ECH13

S/N 2096

Please send the invoice with due date 30 days send to the recipient's address.

In the invoice we need both following addresses :

Customer : Ministerstvo vnitra ČR
Nad Štolou 936/3
170 34 Praha7

Recipient : Policie ČR letecká služba
P.O.BOX 2
163 00Praha618
IČO : 00007064
DIČ : CZ00007064
Bank.spoj. 5504-881/0710



Spare parts are to be delivered directly to our Police Aviation
Department. The address is :

Delivery address:
Czech Police Aviation Department
Airport Praha Ruzyne,
south area
Hangar "D"

Contract - 10/21/IG.FOS

Zakázka je vypořádána Smlouvou o materiálně technickém zabezpečení
Č. j. Ls-758-24/čj-2019-9800KR



LS PČR - oddělení nákupu

Od:

Odesláno:
Komu:
Kopie:

Předmět:

24. května 2024 9:05

RE: VALVE ASSY, ADJUSTED repair

C2 - Confidential

Dea

Estimation price for repair PN 0319950340 is 5.900 Euro. Could be Iess, depends from the level of repair. Will be
identified in RC.

Kind regards,

Customer Service Representative
Safran Helicopter Engines Germany GmbH

Borsteler Chaussee 43
22453 Hamburg
www.safran-helicopter-engines.com

SUBSCRIBE TOTHE SAFRAN NEWS

Sitz der Gesellschaft: Hamburg Amtsgericht Hamburg HRB 47905
Geschäftsfúhrung:
Bankverbindung: Deutsche Bank AG DE89 3607 0050 0113 1184 00
USt-ID: DE118688984

-----Original Message-----
From:
Sent: Freitag, 24. Mai 2024 08:20
To:
Cc:

Subject: valve assy, ADJUSTED repair

CAUTION: This message originated from an outside organization. In case of suspicion, click on "Report to SAFRAN
Security" from the Outlook ribbon.

Hello

we would like to send VALVE ASSY, ADJUSTED for repair. We had to remove it from engine 33140 due to defective
STOP ELECTRO VALVE. Can you send us rough price estimation in advance?
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