
We order Stata/MP(8-core)software/permanent for the project TAČR Sigma DC3 dr. 

Invoice item     Qty/Unit             Single Price VAT        Price

____________________________________________________________________________________________
Stata/MP(8-core)SW/permanent                  1 PC     2.620,00      2.620,00

Order Number: 2204   WBS Element: TA1230111

____________________________________________________________________________________________

Total order value:         2.620,00 USD

Date: Date:

Orderer of the operation for the customer: Vendor Sign:

Budget administrator of the customer:

Invoicing Address

Commercial Name: Mendelova univerzita v Brně
Faculty: Provozně ekonomická fakulta
Registered office-Invoicing
address: Zemědělská 1, Brno
Post Code: 613 00
VAT No.: CZ62156489
ID: 62156489
Bank:
Account No.:

Vendor:

SciExperts AG

Grand Places 14 , Fribourg
1700

23144

Page: 1 from 1

Purchase Order No.: 3511000563 Date of 20.03.2024 
____________________________________________________________________________________________

Instructions for the supply of invoice item
Delivery date: 22.04.2024
Address: Mendelova univerzita v Brně,

Provozně ekonomická fakulta, Zemědělská 1, 613 00 Brno
Way of takeover:  
Payment Terms: within 30 days Due net
Administrator:
Phone No.:
E-mail: @mendelu.cz

____________________________________________________________________________________________

Mendel University in Brno
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From: xxxxx xxxxx < xxxxx. xxxxx @sciexperts.com> 
Sent: Thursday, March 21, 2024 1:01:33 PM 
To: xxxxx xxxxx < xxxxx. xxxxx @mendelu.cz> 
Cc: xxxxx xxxxx < xxxxx. xxxxx @mendelu.cz>; xxxxx xxxxx xxxxx < xxxxx. xxxxx @mendelu.cz> 
Subject: Re: STATA/MP licence permanentní - dotaz  
  
Dobrý den, paní xxxxx,  
 
děkujeme za Vaší objednávku, kterou nyní vyřizujeme. 
 
Kolegyně Vám vystaví fakturu a zašle licenci na Váš email během 1-2 pracovních dnů 
 
S přáním pěkného dne, 
 
xxxxx xxxxx 
 
On 2024-03-21T11:57:09.000+01:00, xxxxx xxxxx < xxxxx. xxxxx @mendelu.cz> wrote: 
Paní xxxxx, 
 
dnes jsem zajistila všechny podpisy a zasílám v příloze objednávku. 
 
S přáním pěkného dne  
 
Xxxxx 
 
Ing. xxxxx xxxxx 
Project manager 
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