Kopitz Daniel

od: nhleisuregroupsales.ce@nh-hotels.com

Odeslano: Utery 12. bfezna 2024 8:19

Komu: Kopitz Daniel; nhwiencity@nh-hotels.com

Predmeét: Re: [ Ticket: 2194619 ] FW: MB0003843485 Question about Reservation (29 Guests)

- University of Ostrava, CZ

NH | HOTEL GROUP

-
Voor een snelle verwerking verzoeken wij u het email onderwerp niet aan te passen.
To ensure a faster processing, please leave the subject line unchanged.

Afin d’assurer un traitement plus rapide, veuillez laisser le sujet inchangé.

Dear Daniel.

We have duly received the countersigned contract as formal confirmation of all services reserved, of which we thank
you.

We are glad to inform you that you will continue for payments and all operational/logistic matters with the person
responsible for your booking in the hotel, the Front Office Manager, who is reading us in copy (nhwiencity@nh-
hotels.com) and who may be reached by phone at the following number +43 1 521720.

We remain at your disposal for any further information and clarifications you may need. We look forward to welcoming
you in NH Hotel Group.

Regards

Ivonne Alexandra Bautista Diaz
Groups & Events Management

NORTHERN EUROPE

T.+49 302238 50 17 - 2490 | www.nh-hotels.com
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NH HOTEL GROUP, S.A. (hereinafter “NH HOTEL GROUP”) will process the personal data collected for the purpose of managing the
relationship and contact and, where appropriate, responding to your requests. You can contact us at the address calle Santa
Engracia 120, 7, 28003, Madrid. The legal basis for processing is the legitimate interest. You can access, rectify, delete, oppose, limit the
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NH HOTEL GROUP, S.A. (hereinafter “NH HOTEL GROUP") will process the personal data collected for the purpose of managing the
relationship and contfact and, where appropriate, responding to your requests. You can contact us at the address calle Santa
Engracia 120, 7, 28003, Madrid. The legal basis for processing is the legitimate interest. You can access, rectify, delete, oppose, limit the
processing or request the portability of your data by contacting dataprotection@nh-hotels.com contacting our Data Protection
Officer via the following email address dpo@nh-hotels.com or contacting the Spanish Data Protection Agency. Your data will be
stored during the relationship and after termination of the same, for the limitation period for legal actions that could result from it. For
further details you can visit our website: https://www.nh-hotels.com/privacy-policy

This e-mail, including any attachments and the information contained therein, is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient of
this message, you are not allowed to use it, copy it or disclose it, totally or partially, by any means. In such event, please send the
message back to the sender and delete it. Any unauthorized publication, use, copy, dissemination or disclosure of this message or any
of its attachments, either in whole or in part, whichever the purpose might be, is strictly prohibited.

For more information in your language visit our website: https://www.nh-hoteles.es/corporate/es/gdpr

From: Daniel.Kopitz@osu.cz

Sent: March 11, 2024 01:26:36 PM

To:nhleisuregroupsales.ce@nh-hotels.com

Subject: RE: [ Ticket: 2194619 ] FW: Question about Reservation (29 Guests) - University of Ostrava, CZ

Dear Ivonne,
thank you for your e-mail. In the attachment, | am sending the signed offer which we accept.

At the same time, for our administrative purposes, | would like to kindly ask you to confirm that you accept us as
your guests at your hotel. With your approval and consesnt, we will upload our contract and the order to our
Register of Contracts at the university. The full saying is following:

Due to the necessity of publication of the order No. OBJ/4515/0011/24 (as stated in the contract) for accommodation
in your hotel from April 22 to 24, 2024 for 30 people in the value of EUR 6,103.66, including city tax and breakfast, in
the Register of Contracts, please confirm acceptance of its wording and give consent to its publication in the Register
of Contracts.

A simple reply to this e-mail that you agree with this will be enough as your consent.

| have one more question: will we receive the final invoice at the end of our stay which we will pay as soon as
possible after that?

Thank you a lot for your help and have a nice day

Daniel

From: nhleisuregroupsales.ce@nh-hotels.com <nhleisuregroupsales.ce@nh-hotels.com>

Sent: Monday, March 11, 2024 12:33 PM

To: Kopitz Daniel <Daniel.Kopitz@osu.cz>

Subject: Re: [ Ticket: 2194619 ] FW: Question about Reservation (29 Guests) - University of Ostrava, CZ



