
CZECH POLICE AVIATION DEPARTMENT
q

Ref. No. LS-2-39/ČJ-2022-9800KR

AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
DEUTSCHLAND GmbH
Industriestr. 4
D-86609 Donauwôrth
GERMANY

ORDER

Prague, P. O. 614, Box 35, Postcode 161 01
Czech Republic

Phone
Fax
E-m

Prague 6.6.2022
No. of pages 2

We request carrying out the repair of the below mentioned item, ordered by our
department, ref. No LS-2-39/Čj-2022-9800KR:

APMS
Unreliable function of AP
button
Helicopter EC135T2
SIN 0310

PIN SIN

416-00298-010 4148 l PC

Please send the invoice with due date 30 days send to the recipient's address.

In the invoice we need both following addresses :

Customer : Ministerstvo vnitra ČR
Nad Štolou 936/3
170 34 Praha 7

Recipient : Policie ČR letecká služba
pošta 614, schr. 35
161 01 Praha 6
IČO : 00007064
DIČ : C7.00007064
Bank.spoj. 5504-881/0710



Spare parts are to be delivered directly to our Police Aviation

Department. The address is :

Delivery address:
Czech Police Aviation Department
Airport Vaclav Havel
south area
Hangar "D"

Contract - LS-427-28/ČJ-2018-9800KR

Zakázka je vypořádána Rámcovou dohodou LS-427-28/ČJ-2018-9800KR k dodávce ND,
oprav, modifikací, modernizace a sluŽeb pro vrtulníky lehké hmotnostní kategorie
EC 135

Vypracov
Vypravil :
Kontrola.'

Ulož. k č.j. P etiist¢ 5
Vyř. znak - lhůta S- 2027



LS PČR - odděleni nákupu

Od:
Odesláno:
Komu:
Předmět:

3. června 2022 16:51
LS PČR - oddělení nákupu
RE: LS-2-39/ČJ-2022-9800KR

Hello,

Thank you for your request.

For MPN 416-00298-010 , we can provide REPAIR under the following conditions :

· Price :13 631EUR
· Price condition : Fixed price
· TAT: 100 Days after entrance of your part within AH logistics platform
· Release certificate proposed : EASA

Waiting for your purchasing, we stay at your disposal if needed.

%oá2

Best Regards, Cordialement,

Material & Logistics Service Center

1!\ "Please precise in your e-mail object: [Company name - Customer code (identified on AR) - Customer Segment
(mentioned in your CLM electronic signature) - sales Organization as AHF or AHD - Customer order].
For example: [Airbus Helicopters - 55000000 - Privilege - AH F - Your internal reference]"

De :
Envoyé : jeudi 2 juin 2022 12:06
Á :
objet : fw: LS-2-39/Čj-2022-9800KR

obchodní referent

[Strana]



www.policie.cz
LETECKÁ SLUŽBA POLICIE ČR

Ekonomický odbor

p.ú.614, schr. 35,
16101Praha 6

,Fi Pomáhat a chránit

From: LS PČR - oddělenI nákupu
Sent: Thursday, june 02, 2022 12:04 PM
To:
Subject: LS-2-39/Čj-2022-9800KR

Dear,
We would like to ask you to sen dus a price quotation for the repair- see attachment
Helicopter EC135T2 S/N 0340

Ministry of the interior CR customer number 55010475

Thank you very much
Have a nice day

obchodní referent

www.policie.cz
LETECKÁ SLUŽBA POLICIE ČR
Ekonomický odbor

p.ú.614, schr. 35,
16101 Praha 6

L

:Wif ,', F| Pomáhat a chránit

The information in this e-tnail is confidential The contents inay not be disclosed or used by anyone other than the addressee Access to this e-mail by anyone else is (lnalltlborised
lřyou are not the intended recipient, please notifý Airbus immediately and delete this e-inaiL
Airbus cannot accept any responsibility for the accuracy or completeness of this e-mail as it lias been sent over public networks. If you have any concerns over the content of this
inessage or its Accuracy or Integrity, please contact Airbus immediately.
All outgoing e-mails fřoin Airbus are checked using regularly updated virus scanning software but you should take whatever ineasures you deem to be appropriate to ensure that this
message and any attachments are virus fřee.
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