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GODEAL24 
ADDRESS 

Shun Feng lntemational Centre 3B-09, 182 Queen's Road East, Wanchai, Hong Kong 

EMAIL 

service@godea124.com 

Order #GO2008104309883 

Order Date: June 14, 2022 

Billing Address 

Institute oj Experimental Botany oj the Czech Academy oj Sciences, v. v. i. Rozvojova 

263 

Prague, 16502 

Czech Republic 

T- +420220390352

Payment Method 

Cwalletco 

Items Ordered 

Product Name 

MS Office 2021 Pro Plus/ 5 PCs 

Subtotal 

Grand Tota! 

Grand Tota! to be Charged 

SKU Price Qty Subtotal 

GDL000 112-
S 0

, Ordered: \'3 99 6
.
., 2 74 . .) 54 

J) ' 7. -

$3,997.62 

$3,997.62 

€3,899.88 

http s ://www.godeal24.com/sa les/order/prinUorder _id/284159/ 

Print Order # GO2008104309883 
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 UEB

Od:
Odesláno:
Komu:
Předmět:

úterý 14. června 2022 10:36 
Kadlecova Lenka UEB 
Fwd: Office 2021

Od: Godeal24.com <service@godeal24.com> 
Odesláno: pondělí 13. června 2022 13:26 
Komu: @ueb.cas.cz <@ueb.cas.cz> 
Předmět: Re: Office 2021 

Hi UEB, 

Please kindly purchase from our website directly, then you will receive the confirmation order. 

On Mon, 13 Jun at 7:19 AM , Nulicek Josef UEB <nulicek@ueb.cas.cz> wrote:  
Good afternoon, 
I would like to purchase 54pcs. Office Pro licenses for Office 2021 Pro.  
Because we are ordering from a company, I need to issue and confirm an order before I purchase a 
license.  
Would it be possible to send me a confirmed order by email? Thank you. 

Regards. 
 

IT Administrator

e-mail:  @ueb.cas.cz

telefon: 

web:     www.ueb.cas.cz

ÚEB, AVČR, v.v.i. • Rozvojová 263 • Praha 6-Lysolaje • 16502 • Česká republika 

114890:1992512

xxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxx


	scan
	obj_MS

