Loksa Jiri

Od: Gabriela Tomescu <gabriela.tomescu@bergenstrahle.se>

Odeslano: patek 3. prosince 2021 13:12

Komu: Loksa Jifi

Kopie: Bauer Karel; Frajovéa Blanka

Predmét: Sv: Order 21912627, MN23701URGENT 79139, USPTO SN 16/365707 Update - Order

Aknowledgement

Hello Jiri,
We confirm receipt of this order. We will send the invoice as requested.

Best regards,
Gabriela

Gabriela Tomescu

Patent Attorney and U.S. Intellectual Property Attorney
Attorney at Law

Let"s connect on LinkedIn

Bergenstrahle & Partners AB, SE-118 93 Stockholm, Sweden
Direct: +46 76 534 57 75. Office: +46 10 750 07 51

BERGENSTRAHLE @ PARTNERS

fetlurn on innovation

The information contained in this transmission may contain privileged and confidential information. It is intended only for the use of the
person(s) named above. If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that any review, dissemination, distribution or duplication
of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply email and destroy all
copies of the original message. To reply to our email administrator directly, please send an email to info@bergenstrahle.se.

Bergenstrahle & Partners is a member of the Association of Intellectual Property Law Firms in Sweden. Unless otherwise agreed upon, all
services rendered by Bergenstrahle & Partners are subject to our Terms and Conditions available at bergenstrahle.se.

Fran: Loksa Jifi <Jiri.Loksa@eli-beams.eu>

Skickat: den 3 december 2021 12:25

Till: Gabriela Tomescu <gabriela.tomescu@bergenstrahle.se>

Kopia: Bauer Karel <Karel.Bauer@eli-beams.eu>; Frajova Blanka <Blanka.Frajova@eli-beams.eu>
Amne: Order 21912627, MN23701URGENT 79139, USPTO SN 16/365707 Update

Dear Gabiriela,
| am sending you an official order. Please confirm it within two business days.

Invoice has to be sent to e-mail address efaktury@fzu.cz, otherwise it will not be paid.
There is VAT in order, because it was generated by our IT Program. Please do not pay a attention to it.

Invoice address: Fyzikalni Gstav AV CR, v.v.i, Na Slovance 1999/2, Praha 8 182 21




Thank you.

S pozdravem / Best regards,
Mgr. Jifi Loksa
Procurement specialist

EI] il
ELI Beamlines Czech Republic

E-mail: jiri.loksa@eli-beams.eu
Tel.: +420 266 051 304

Mobil: +420 601 555 059
www.eli-beams.eu

Fyzikalni dstav Akademie véd CR, v.v.i.
Eli-beams.eu

Za Radnici 835

252 41 Dolni Bfezany

0Od: Gabriela Tomescu <gabriela.tomescu@bergenstrahle.se>
Odesldno: patek 19. listopadu 2021 11:39

Komu: Bauer Karel <Karel.Bauer@eli-beams.eu>

Pfedmét: Sv: URGENT 79139, USPTO SN 16/365707 Update

Hello Karel,
This case needs to be revived- B&P will pay the fee.

As for my work, the responses to an Office Action are 2-5 hours (600 euros to 1500 euros), depending on how much
work | need to do. Erica will also spend 1-3 hours (180-540 euros).

Thus the estimate is 780 — 2100 euros, excluding VAT.
| hope this helps.

Best regards,
Gabriela

Gabriela Tomescu

Patent Attorney and U.S. Intellectual Property Attorney
Attorney at Law

Let"s connect on LinkedIn

Bergenstrahle & Partners AB, SE-118 93 Stockholm, Sweden
Direct: +46 76 534 57 75. Office: +46 10 750 07 51

BERGENSTRAHLE @' PARTNERS

1 on Srrovol o

The information contained in this transmission may contain privileged and confidential information. It is intended only for the use of the
person(s) named above. If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that any review, dissemination, distribution or duplication



of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply email and destroy all
copies of the original message. To reply to our email administrator directly, please send an email to info@bergenstrahle.se.

Bergenstrahle & Partners is a member of the Association of Intellectual Property Law Firms in Sweden. Unless otherwise agreed upon, all
services rendered by Bergenstrahle & Partners are subject to our Terms and Conditions available at bergenstrahle.se.

Fran: Bauer Karel <Karel.Bauer@eli-beams.eu>

Skickat: den 8 november 2021 13:24

Till: Gabriela Tomescu <gabriela.tomescu@bergenstrahle.se>
Amne: RE: URGENT 79139, USPTO SN 16/365707 Update

Dear Gabiriela,
Could you please send met he total cost estimation for this case, including the Attorney fee?

Furthermore, we will send the priority document directly to USPTO. Could you please send us an
accompanying letter with formality, if any?

Thank you in advance.
Karel

From: Gabriela Tomescu <gabriela.tomescu@bergenstrahle.se>

Sent: Thursday, October 28, 2021 11:54 AM

To: Bauer Karel <Karel.Bauer@eli-beams.eu>

Subject: {Possible SPAM} URGENT 79139, USPTO SN 16/365707 Update
Importance: High

Dear Karel,

| am sorry to let you know that the above-mentioned application has become abandoned at the USPTO. We received a
Non-Final Office Action from the USPTO in March, but though an administrative failure, the Office Action and the
respective deadline was not entered into our calendaring system. | can revive the application instantly on-line by paying
the revival fee and filing a response to the Office Action. Since this administrative oversight was on our side, our firm
will pay for the revival fee.

In order to revive the patent application, we will need to respond to the attached Office Action. | have prepared for you
a shell amendment that you can use for drafting the response.

| reviewed the Office Action and corrected the indefiniteness rejections. Claim 12 seems to me unclear in the
highlighted part; perhaps we can revise it a bit, if you agree.

| need your help regarding the obviousness rejection.

We will need to revive this application within 12 months, in order to be able to do so instantaneously online.

Please let me know when | can expect your feedback.
Again, | am really sorry about this.

Best regards,
Gabriela



Gabriela Tomescu

Patent Attorney and U.S. Intellectual Property Attorney
Attorney at Law

Let s connect on LinkedIn

Bergenstrahle & Partners AB, SE-118 93 Stockholm, Sweden
Direct: +46 76 534 57 75. Office: +46 10 750 07 51
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1 on Srrovol o

The information contained in this transmission may contain privileged and confidential information. It is intended only for the use of the
person(s) named above. If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that any review, dissemination, distribution or duplication
of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply email and destroy all
copies of the original message. To reply to our email administrator directly, please send an email to info@bergenstrahle.se.

Bergenstrahle & Partners is a member of the Association of Intellectual Property Law Firms in Sweden. Unless otherwise agreed upon, all
services rendered by Bergenstrahle & Partners are subject to our Terms and Conditions available at bergenstrahle.se.



