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Dear Ms. , 

Nice to have your email. 

We  confirm your official order. 
Please kindly find attached our invoice. 

all the best,

IBM Watson Health Micromedex Solutions
Distributor for CEE

ITSN İletişim Teknolojisi Sistemleri Ltd.

T. 

On Monday, December 7, 2020, 06:18:55 PM GMT+3, knihovna <knihovna@sukl.cz> wrote:

Dear ,

I send you our official order. Please, confirm this order by my e-mail. And then it will be possible to issue an invoice.

 

Thank you for very much your cooperation.

 

Your sincerely,

 

 

Press and Information Unit

STATE INSTITUTE

FOR DRUG
CONTROL

Phone: 

 

www.sukl.cz

 

 

 




invoice


Invoice Date 11.12.2020


ITSN Ltd. Due Date 10.01.2021


ITSN İletişim Teknolojisi Sistemleri Invoice No: GIB2020000000033


Sanayi ve Tic. Limited Şirketi
Koza Sokak No:40/24 Büyük Esat Customer


Çankaya Ankara / Turkey
Tel: +90 312 431 85 24
Internet: www.iletisimteknolojisi.com
Tax office: Cumhuriyet
Tax number: 469 053 6423
Registration no: 376801 VAT No. CZ000023817


ORDERED UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL


1 USD $7.600,00


1 USD $5.250,00


Renewal & Supply of the following


IBM Watson Health - Micromedex Product/s:


Online Access Single User


Expanded Disease Information


Expanded Drug Information 


INTERNATIONAL CUSTOMERS: ITSN is not responsible for any applicable taxes, duties or other unknown recepient 


charges not specifically reflected in ITSN's invoice in detail


DESCRIPTION


Czech Republic
100 41 Praha 10
Srobarova 48
Drug Control
State Institute for


1 USD $1.400,00


1 USD $1.500,00


Only: Sub Total $15.750,00


VAT % N/A $0,00


Bank Payment Details: Grand Total $15.750,00


Bank Name: ISBANK, Incesu Branch


Swift Code: ISBKTRIS


USD:  TR82 0006 4000 0024 2300 1999 27


THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS


Please be sure to include any applicable wire fees


Please quote our invoice number when transmitting funds


Renewal Period: 28th Sept. 2020 to 


Payment in 30 days


…fifteenthousandsevenhundredfiftyamericandollars…


27th Sept. 2021


Index Nominum


Martindale






i)

SUKL





 

From:  
Sent: Tuesday, November 24, 2020 7:30 AM
To: knihovna <knihovna@sukl.cz>; knihovna <knihovna@sukl.cz>
Subject: RE: Micromedex Renewal 2020 - SUKL

 

Dear Ms. ,

 

Thank you very much for your confirmation.

 

Looking forward to have your official order to issue our invoice.

 

I wish you and your esteemed organizasyon all the best health amidst the covid19 pandemic.

 

Yours sincerely, 

 

 

 

Android’de Yahoo Postadan gönderildi

 

16:00’’23e’ 23 Kas 2020 Pzt tarihinde, knihovna

<knihovna@sukl.cz> şunu yazdı:

Dear ,

 

thank you for your subscription extension offer.

 

I will send you our order, then please confirm it and then it will be possible to issue an invoice.

 

Thank you for your cooperation and good health,

 

 

 

Press and Information Unit

STATE INSTITUTE

FOR DRUG
CONTROL

Phone: 

 

www.sukl.cz

 

https://go.onelink.me/107872968?pid=InProduct&c=Global_Internal_YGrowth_AndroidEmailSig__AndroidUsers&af_wl=ym&af_sub1=Internal&af_sub2=Global_YGrowth&af_sub3=EmailSignature
mailto:knihovna@sukl.cz


 

 

 

 

 

From:  
Sent: Monday, November 09, 2020 8:54 AM
To: knihovna <knihovna@sukl.cz>; 
Subject: Micromedex Renewal 2020 - SUKL

 

Dear Ms. ,

 

I hope you're fine and doing ok. 

 

Please kindly find attached your renewal quote for Micromedex 2020-2021 subscription period. 

 

Looking forward to have your renewal confirmation,

 

wishing you the best health, 

 

IBM Watson Health - Micromedex Solutions 

Distributor for CEE

ITSN İletişim Teknolojisi Sistemleri Ltd.

T. 

mailto:knihovna@sukl.cz



