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Od: Vollrath Dirksen

Komu: Rabasovéa Tereza
Kopie: Bettina Bilogan
Predmet: Re: Order
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Hi Tereza,

just for the completeness the order acknowledgement.



mailto:Tereza.Rabasova@eli-beams.eu

mailto:Bettina.Bilogan@nateurope.com



Netzwerk und Automatisierungs-Technologie

N.A.T. GmbH, Konrad-Zuse-Platz 9, D-53227 Bonn
ELI Beamlines - Fyzikalni Ustav AV CR, v.v.i

Na Slovance 2
18221 Praha 8

Gesellschaft fiir
Netzwerk- und Automatisierungs-Technologie mbH
Konrad-Zuse-Platz 9

53227 Bonn

Germany

Phone: ++49-(0)228-965864-0
Fax:  ++49-(0)228-965864-10
VAT: DE123375980

Czech Republic

WEB: www.nateurope.com

Date: 14.11.2016

Dear FZU-Team,

we thank you very much for your order and confirm as follows:

Order Confirmation: 1611142

Your Purchase Order: Order 0016920288-CZ.02.1.01/0.0/0.0/15_008/0000162 dated: 24.10.2016

Pos  Product Option  Description/ Firmware /Rem. Qty Shipping Price Dis.% Amount
1 NAMC-EXT-RTM- Double full size RTM extender 2 18.11.2016 450,00 O 900,00 €
R with RTM connector
2  NAMC-EXT-RTM-F -PS Double full size AMC extender 2 18.11.2016 990,00 O 1980,00 €

with RTM connector
additional on-board 3.3V power
supply for stand-alone operation

Project Number 1 18.11.2016 0,00 O 0,00€
CZ.02.1.01/0.0/0.0/15_008/0000

162 - Project Name ELI -

Extreme Light Infrastructure

3 Remark - Note

Total: 2880,00 €

Terms of delivery: - EXW N.A.T. according to above mentioned delivery date

Terms of payment: 30 days net

Notes:
- Prices are net, carriage does not include delivery, packing, taxes or customs duty

- Acceptance of this confirmation implies acceptance of our conditions

- According to some of our products underlying additional export restrictions not only of the Federal
Republic of Germany, but e.g. of the USA, the purchaser is responsible to observe all applicaple export
restrictions, regulations and/or instructions.

Best regards and thank you,

N.A.T. GmbH
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Geschéftsfiihrer: Dip.Phys H.Laufkotter
VR-Bank Rhein-Sieg eG - Kto. 5103 434 019 - BLZ 370 695 20
HRG Siegburg B3233 - Firmensitz Siegstrasse 130 - D-53757 Sankt Augustin









Best regards
Vollrath

Am 24.01.2017 um 16:03 schrieb vollrath@nateurope.com <vd@nateurope.com>:

Hi Tereza,

we already shipped the goods. Please see attached delivery note. 


Best regards
Vollrath


<Lfs.pdf>
Am 24.01.2017 um 15:37 schrieb Rabasová Tereza <Tereza.Rabasova@eli-beams.eu>:

Dear Vollrath,
 
I still have not received the Order acknowledgment. I need it for our evidence.
 
Please send me it ASAP!
 
Thank you in advance.
 
Tereza
 
From: Vollrath Dirksen [mailto:vollrath@nateurope.com] 
Sent: Friday, December 16, 2016 3:46 PM
To: Rabasová Tereza
Subject: Re: Order


 
Hi Tereza,
 

thank you very much for the reminder. I will talk to Bettina and ensure that order acknowledgment will go out latest Monday.

 

Best regards

Vollrath

 
Am 16.12.2016 um 15:15 schrieb Rabasová Tereza <Tereza.Rabasova@eli-beams.eu>:

 
Dear Volllrath,

 

I still have not got the Order confirmation. Could you please send it to me?

 

Thank you.

 

Tereza

 

From: Vollrath Dirksen [mailto:vollrath@nateurope.com] 
Sent: Monday, November 14, 2016 1:00 PM
To: Rabasová Tereza
Cc: Pivoňka Petr; Bettina Bilogan
Subject: Re: Order



 

Dear Tereza,

 


thank you for your order. Bettina will process your order and send you the order acknowledgement. 


 


Best regards


Vollrath


 

Am 14.11.2016 um 12:14 schrieb Rabasová Tereza <Tereza.Rabasova@eli-beams.eu>:


 

Dear Vollrath,


 


I am sending you an Order based on Contract with your company. Please confirm it and send it as soon as possible.


 


I would like to kindly ask you to ad to an Invoice order number and number of project CZ.02.1.01/0.0/0.0/15_008/0000162 name ELI - EXTREME LIGHT INFRASTRUCTURE - fáze 2. Our company prefer e-invoicing to efaktury@fzu.cz. Due to our long authorization procedure, we need to make a payment via Invoice with due at least 21 days.


 


There is VAT in orders, because It was generated by our IT Program. Please do not pay a attention to it.


 


Thank you very much for understanding and cooperation.


 


Kind Regards, 


 


Ing. Tereza Rabasová


Procurement  specialist
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ELI Beamlines Czech Republic


Tel.: +420 266 051396


Mobil:  +420 702 195 269


E-mail: tereza.rabasova@eli-beams.eu


www.eli-beams.eu


 


Fyzikální ústav AV ČR, v. v. i.
Na Slovance 1999/2
182 21 Praha 8


 


Kontaktní adresa:


Fyzikální ústav AV ČR, v.v.i./ ELI Beamlines


Za Radnicí 835


252 41 Dolní Břežany


 


S pozdravem,


 


Ing. Tereza Rabasová


Procurement  specialist
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