From:

atek 29. brezna 2019 15:17
To: '
Subject: Fwd: AW: AW: warranty repair
Attachments: RE19-00626.pdf
Ahoj,

to je za opravu diod z Ingenericu. Souhlasim s vysi ceny.

-------- Pteposlana zprava --------
Predmét:AW: AW: warranty repair

Hello -

Please find attached our invoice for the repair.

Best regards,

| Accounting/Administration
Tel.: +49 241 963-3242
Email (@ingeneric.com

Hello -

I will double-check an- or myself will come back to you, soon.

Reiards
_ | Managing Director



Tel.: +49 241 963-1342
Email: -@ingeneric.com

INGENERIC GmbH

Dennewartstrasse 25-27 - 52068 Aachen - Germany

Tel.: +49 241 963-1340 | Fax: +49 241 963-1349 E-Mail: contact(@ingeneric.com | WWww.ingeneric.com
Sitz der GmbH: Aachen — Amtsgericht Aachen HRB 8673 — Geschéftsfiihrung: Dr. Stefan Hambiicker, Dr.
Olaf Riibenach Registered Office of GmbH: Aachen — District Court Aachen HRB 8673 — Management: Dr.
Stefan Hambuecker, Dr. Olaf Ruebenach

Diese E-Mail konnte vertrauliche und/ oder rechtlich geschiitzte Informationen enthalten. Wenn Sie nicht
der richtige Adressat sind oder diese E-Mail irrtiimlich erhalten haben, informieren Sie bitte sofort den
Absender und vernichten Sie diese Mail. Das unerlaubte Kopieren sowie die unbefugte Weitergabe dieser
Mail ist nicht gestattet.

This e-mail may contain confidential and/ or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient (or
have received this e-mail in error) please notify the sender immediately and destroy this e-mail. Any
unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this e-mail is strictly forbidden.

IT Please consider your environmental responsibility before printing this e-mail.

ear il

do you already know, how much will you charge for travel and manpower?

Regards,

Dne 27.2.2019 v 21:15 _ napsal(a):

ear

we agree that the stack is covered by warranty. I really appreciate if you cover the service
cost itself with regard to travel and manpower.

Best 1-
|

| Managing Director
Tel.: +49 241 963-1342
Email: (@ingeneric.com

INGENERIC GmbH
Dennewartstrasse 25-27 - 52068 Aachen - Germany
Tel.: +49 241 963-1340 |Fax: +49 241 963-1349
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E-Mail: contact@ingeneric.com | www.ingeneric.com Sitz der GmbH: Aachen —
Amtsgericht Aachen HRB 8673 — Geschiftsfithrung: Dr. Stefan Hambiicker, Dr. Olaf
Riibenach Registered Office of GmbH: Aachen — District Court Aachen HRB 8673 —
Management: Dr. Stefan Hambuecker, Dr. Olaf Ruebenach

Diese E-Mail konnte vertrauliche und/ oder rechtlich geschiitzte Informationen enthalten.
Wenn Sie nicht der richtige Adressat sind oder diese E-Mail irrtlimlich erhalten haben,
informieren Sie bitte sofort den Absender und vernichten Sie diese Mail. Das unerlaubte
Kopieren sowie die unbefugte Weitergabe dieser Mail ist nicht gestattet.

This e-mail may contain confidential and/ or privileged information. If you are not the
intended recipient (or have received this e-mail in error) please notify the sender immediately
and destroy this e-mail. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material
in this e-mail is strictly forbidden.

IT Please consider your environmental responsibility before printing this e-mail.

Von: (@fzu.cz>

Gesendet: Montag, 25. Februar 2019 09:58
An: ingeneric.com>
Cc: (@ingeneric.com>

Betreff: warranty repair

ear

recent service visit didnt reveal any user fault in pump engine, so I would like to ask, whether
the replaced stack will be covered by warranty as mentioned in the quote. Im willing to cover
travel and manpower costs.

Thank you and best regards,

, Ph.D.
Senior researcher

HiLASE Centre

Institute of Physics ASCR, v.v.i.
Za Radnici 828

25241 Dolni Biezany

Czech Republic

Phone: +420 314 007 721
ResearcherID: G-6246-2014
http://www.hilase.cz

Tento email se vSemi ptfilohami a obsazenymi informacemi je diveérny a uréen vyhradné a jen
adresatovi. Pokud jste jej obdrzeli nedopatfenim a nebyl vam urcen, zaslete jej prosim zpét
odesilateli a vymaZzte jej. Neautorizované zvetejnéni, pouziti, sifeni nebo prozrazeni teto celé
zpravy ¢i jeji ¢asti je ptisné zakazano.

Neni-li v této zpraveé vyslovné uvedeno jinak, neni tato e-mailova zprava navrhem na
uzavieni smlouvy ani pfijetim ptipadného navrhu na uzavieni smlouvy a nezaklada
pfedsmluvni odpovédnost FZU AV CR, v.v.i.



This e-mail, any attachments and the information contained therein ("this message") are
confidential and intended solely for the use of the addressee(s). If you have received this
message in error please send it back to the sender and delete it. Unauthorized publication,
use, dissemination or disclosure of this message, either in whole or in part is strictly
prohibited.

If not expressly stated otherwise, this e-mail message cannot be considered as a proposal to
conclude a contract, neither the acceptance of a proposal to conclude a contract, nor does it
create any pre-contractual liability of the part of FZU AV CR, v.v.1.

Senior researcher

HiLASE Centre

Institute of Physics ASCR, v.v.i.
Za Radnici 828

25241 Dolni Biezany

Czech Republic

Phone: +420 314 007 721
ResearcherID: G-6246-2014
http://www.hilase.cz

Tento email se vS§emi pfilohami a obsazenymi informacemi je divérny a ur€en vyhradné a jen adresatovi.
Pokud jste jej obdrzeli nedopatfenim a nebyl vam urcen, zaslete jej prosim zpét odesilateli a vymazte jej.
Neautorizované zveiejnéni, pouziti, siteni nebo prozrazeni teto celé zpravy ¢i jeji ¢asti je piisné zakazano.

Neni-li v této zpraveé vyslovné uvedeno jinak, neni tato e-mailova zprava navrhem na uzavieni smlouvy ani
piijetim ptipadného navrhu na uzavieni smlouvy a nezakladéa pfedsmluvni odpovédnost FZU AV CR, v.v.i.

This e-mail, any attachments and the information contained therein ("this message") are confidential and
intended solely for the use of the addressee(s). If you have received this message in error please send it back
to the sender and delete it. Unauthorized publication, use, dissemination or disclosure of this message, either
in whole or in part is strictly prohibited.

If not expressly stated otherwise, this e-mail message cannot be considered as a proposal to conclude a
contract, neither the acceptance of a proposal to conclude a contract, nor does it create any pre-contractual
liability of the part of FZU AV CR, v.v.i.





