From: Giulia Neri <giulia.neri@metergroup.de>
Date: ct 20. 12. 2018 v 9:24

Subject: AW: Pawkit_

To: Kuéerova Iva <kucerovai@ftz.czu.cz>

Fine, thank you so much!

We will prepare the invoice and send you the instrument as soon as possible.

Best Regards

Giulia Neri

METER

Giulia Neri
Sales Manager

METER Group AG

Mettlacher Str. 8, 81379 Miinchen

T +49 89 12665256 F +49 89 12665220

E giulia.neri@metergroup.de W www.metergroup.com

Von: lva Kucerova <kucerovai@ftz.czu.cz>
Gesendet: Mittwoch, 19. Dezember 2018 17:08
An: Giulia Neri <giulia.neri@metergroup.de>
Betreff: Re: Pawkit_ Payment within 30 days
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Dear Giulia,

| confirm the order of aw meter Pawkit (Decagon, US). The invoice should be written on:

Ceska zemedelska univerzita v Praze

Kamycka 129

Praha 6

165 00

ICO: 60460709

DIC: CZ60460709

As the contact person please write my name and faculty: lva Kucerova, FTZ.

Thank you for your cooperation!

Best regards,

Iva Kucerova

st 19. pros 2018 16:02 odesilatel Giulia Neri <giulia.neri@metergroup.de> napsal:

Dear lva,

| check it internally and it is possible for you to make the payment afterwards, within 30
days.


mailto:giulia.neri@metergroup.de

So as soon as you send me the written confirmation | can prepare the order and the Pawkit
can be shipped directly this week.

Kindest Regards

Giulia

METER

Giulia Neri
Sales Manager

METER Group AG

Mettlacher Str. 8, 81379 Miinchen

T +49 89 12665256 F +49 89 12665220

E giulia.neri@metergroup.de W www.metergroup.com

METER Group AG (vormals UMS AG)
Vorstand: Georg von Unold // Aufsichtsratsvorsitzender: Florian von Unold
Amtsgericht Miinchen, HRB 223356 // Umsatzsteuer-ldentifikationsnummer: DE 129508256
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