
Lmhartov^Oj^a

Od: Lucy Liu <lucy@mtixtl.com>
Odesláno: středa 28. listopadu 2018 19:08
Komu: Linhartová Olga
Kopie: Grym Jan
Předmět: Re: FW: Order 0018010863
Přílohy: CZ112718L.pdf

Dear Olga

rc_PQT-0000246

Thank you very much for your PO. It is confirmed, and will be shipped out right after your payment.

Please see attached proforma invoice

Best Regards 

Lucy

MTI Corporation -since 1994
860 South 19th Street, Richmond, CA 94804, USA www.mtixtLcom Tel: 510-525-3070 Fax: 510-525-4705 
Find Equipment by Application:

CVD & PECVD & Hydrogen Tube Furnaces
Beyond Lithium-ion Batteries & Solid State Electrolyte
High Throughput Equipment for MGI Material Research
Sample Preparation Cutting, Polishing, Mixing, Pressing & Heating Processing 

Pouch Cell Battery R&D Equipment 

Single Crystal substrates A-Z

On Tue, Nov 27, 2018 at 11:35 PM Linhartová Olga <linhartova@,ufe.cz> wrote: 

Dear Mrs. Lucy Liu,

Please find attached our Order 0018010863. Please confirm us this order.

Best regards,

Olga Linhartova
| INSTITUTE OF PHOTONICS AND ELECTRONICS AS CR, v.v.i.
I Chaberská 57 

18251 Praha 8 -  Kobylisy 
I CZECH REPUBLIC
| Tel: +420 266773561, Fax: +420 284680222 E-mail: linhartova@ufe.cz
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